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This book offers specific information on how the RV lifestyle is cost effective.
You can save money and go where and when you want and live the wanderlust
lifestyle. Learn how to buy a "frugal" RV, and even how to camp for free.
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Editorial Review

About the Author
Jeffrey Webber - Bio

Jeffrey Webber has been an avid RVer for forty years. During that time he and his wife have traveled around
this beautiful country a number of times. He has owned a variety of recreational vehicles including Class A,
Class B, and Class C motorhomes, travel trailers, and fifth wheel trailers. He has fully experienced the RV
lifestyle.

Jeffrey was a public school educator for thirty-three years. Many of those years were spent as a Technology
Facilitator for his school district.

In his first book, entitled The New Professional Person's Retirement Lifestyle, Mr. Webber discusses
specific, detailed, creative, and innovative activity-based recommendations for the retiree. The reader is
offered choices to assist in the development of that all-important plan for retirement, which can create a
revitalized outlook for the future.

In his second book, entitled Technology & Your Retirement Lifestyle: Tools For The New You, he discusses
how life can be more accommodating during the retirement years using the "tools of technology." These
same tools do indeed support a mobile lifestyle.

He has also published an article on retirement planning in Sourcebook, which is a journal for financial
planners affiliated with the AIG/Royal Alliance Companies. Jeffrey is passionate about living life to the
fullest during the retirement years. He and his wife have generally experienced most of the recommendations
in this book.

Excerpt. © Reprinted by permission. All rights reserved.
CHAPTER 1: WHAT DO I WANT FROM RETIREMENT?

START WITH A PLAN!

If you are beginning your Third Age (there's that new terminology again), and you are considering the costly
purchase of an RV, you really do need to set some goals for yourself.

It is important for you to take stock of yourself and formulate a course of action that you will definitely
follow. You will need to engage in some thoughtful self-analysis to assist you in focusing on what you really
want to do during retirement.

Here are some important considerations when developing that plan. * Take a personal inventory. Consider
your personal strengths and things that you would like to do better. * Start simply and do not overburden
yourself. Attempt to create a balance in your life between activities and recreation. * Be creative! Remember,
we are living longer, more healthy lives * Remember the R words: reinvention; rediscovery; redefinition;
revitalization; realization

When you've come up with a course of action, then we can begin to think about the RV lifestyle.



My wife and I have been RVers for forty years. We've always had the perspective that the RV lifestyle is a
kind of tool. It can help you put together and implement plans and that you've devised.

Certainly, a mainstay of the RV lifestyle is the support it gives you if you have leisure activities in that all-
important plan. I am reminded of Ernie Zelinski's book, The Joy of Not Working. He encourages you to
consider leisure activities that turn you on now, new activities that you have considered doing, and activities
that will get you physically fit. So, if part of your plan includes playing golf, biking, fishing, hiking, or
swimming, your RV can obviously take you where the action is.

In my first book, The New Professional Person's Retirement Lifestyle, I discuss chapter after chapter of
things to do during your retirement. If you incorporate ideas from the book into your retirement plan, your
RV can become your real base of operations. For example, if you are interested in volunteerism, you can
readily volunteer from the comfort of the rig, or, the rig can accommodate you while at a volunteer
destination. The same scenario applies to working while camping, commonly called workamping. These
topics will be discussed later chapters.

In essence, your recreational vehicle becomes a tool with which to implement your retirement plan. My wife
and I pursue cultural interests, hobbies, we continue our education, and we invest, all in the comfort of our
RV.

In 2006 we traveled across the country during the winter months in our Class A motorhome. Choosing from
a variety of attractions from guidebooks and various websites, we chose to visit the Georgia O'Keefe
Museum (one of the most famous art museums) in Santa Fe, New Mexico. We were able to locate a city
campground with public transportation available right outside the gate. During our stay, we dined at various
restaurants and enjoyed other cultural attractions. Additionally, we had all the comforts of home available in
the RV including cable TV and wireless Internet. We enjoyed similar experiences in Las Cruces, New
Mexico and Tucson, Arizona.

My wife and I love to bike. We own a tandem and we've biked in various locations around the country in an
effort to explore the natural beauty of our country. So, when we reach a destination to bike, we do so directly
from the campground from our home on wheels.

Again, all of these activities go toward achieving a goal that is part of our long-term plan for retirement.

I'll discuss more ways this can work in forthcoming chapters of this book.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Kiley Kaufman:

This book untitled RVing & Your Retirement Lifestyle: A Cost Effective Way to Live Your Dreams to be
one of several books which best seller in this year, this is because when you read this e-book you can get a
lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this book in the book retail store or you can order it by way of
online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, since you can
read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason for you to past this e-book from your list.



Joyce Loza:

The e-book with title RVing & Your Retirement Lifestyle: A Cost Effective Way to Live Your Dreams has a
lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This kind of book
exist new know-how the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world
currently. That is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will
bring you with new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read
that anywhere you want.

Patricia Rhee:

RVing & Your Retirement Lifestyle: A Cost Effective Way to Live Your Dreams can be one of your nice
books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary
that will increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless
delivering the information. The article author giving his/her effort that will put every word into satisfaction
arrangement in writing RVing & Your Retirement Lifestyle: A Cost Effective Way to Live Your Dreams but
doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource info that
maybe you can be among it. This great information could drawn you into completely new stage of crucial
thinking.

Glenn Stops:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended to you personally is RVing & Your Retirement Lifestyle: A Cost Effective Way to Live Your
Dreams this book consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. That book was
represented how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer require to explain it is easy to
understand. Often the writer made some exploration when he makes this book. That's why this book
appropriate all of you.
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