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Editorial Review

Review
"[Lawrence was] a writer with an extraordinary sense of the physical world, of the colour and texture and
shape of things, for whom the body was alive and the problems of the body insistent and important." --
Virginia Woolf

From the Publisher
Under-appreciated until now, The Lost Girl is perhaps D.H. Lawrence's most beautiful, thoroughly
contemporary, love story. This captivating novel charts the journey of a woman caught between two worlds
and two lives-one mired in dreary, industrial England and a life of convention, the other set in the vibrant
Italian landscape holding the promise of sensual liberation. Alvina Houghton is fading into spinsterhood
when she meets Naples-born Cicio, a vaudeville dancer who draws her into a dance of seduction,
reawakening her desire as she defies her stifling upper-class life.

From the Inside Flap
"The Lost Girl, D. H. Lawrence's forgotten novel, is a passionate tale of longing and sexual defiance, of
devastation and destitution.
Alvina Houghton, the daughter of a widowed Midlands draper, comes of age just as her father's business is
failing. In a desperate attempt to regain his fortune and secure his daughter's proper upbringing, James
Houghton buys a theater. Among the traveling performers he employs is Ciccio, a sensual Italian who
immediately captures Alvina's attention. Fleeing with him to Naples, she leaves her safe world behind and
enters one of sexual awakening, desire, and fleeting freedom.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Becky Pope:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their free time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, gonna beach, or picnic
within the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill
your own personal free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book is usually option to fill your totally free time/
holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to test
look for book, may be the reserve untitled The Lost Girl can be fine book to read. May be it can be best
activity to you.

Helen Velez:

This The Lost Girl is great reserve for you because the content that is full of information for you who else
always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. That book reveal it details accurately using
great arrange word or we can say no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have
whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward sentences but tough core information with
splendid delivering sentences. Having The Lost Girl in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, data in
it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no publication that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen



moment right but this publication already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs.
hectic do you still doubt which?

Jeffrey Martinez:

Reading a book being new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to examine a book. When you
read a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of
book that you have read. If you need to get information about your research, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics,
and also soon. The The Lost Girl provide you with new experience in looking at a book.

Alberto Alvarez:

That book can make you to feel relax. This book The Lost Girl was colorful and of course has pictures on
there. As we know that book The Lost Girl has many kinds or type. Start from kids until teens. For example
Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there. Therefore , not
at all of book are usually make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose
the best book for you and try to like reading that will.
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